=\Warwick

PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Philip Thornton, Ed.D., Superintendent
Warwick Public Schools

B

TO: Philip Thornton, Ed. D Superintendent

FROM: Anthony Ferrucci, Exe. Director of Finance & Operations

DATE: May 25, 2019

SUBJECT: Bid Award-Toll Gate High School Football Uniforms Bid #19-0019

Attached are copies of Ms. Camely Machado and Mr. Ken Rix’s recommendations to award bid #19-0019, football
uniforms for Toll Gate High School athletics.

Upon review of the documents provided and acknowledging that the School Committee’s ADOPTED Recommended
Budget for Fy2020 has budgeted amounts for these uniforms, | concur with their recommendation to award this bid as
follows:

Company Description Cost
Grogan Marciano Sporting Goods Adidas Football Uniforms, per bid specifications. $10,788.60
TOTAL: $10,788.60

We are requesting that the School Committee consider awarding this contract at the next meeting scheduled for
Tuesday, June 11, 2019.

At the meeting Mr. Rix will be available to answer any questions as they may relate to this recommendation.

Thank you.
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CAMELY MACHADOQO, COORDINATOR 69 Draper Avenue
Non-Instructional Services Warwick, Rhode Island 02889
Camely.Machado@warwickschools.org TEL (401) 734-3035

TO: Anthony Ferrucci

FROM: Camely Machado
DATE: May 14, 2019

SUBJECT: Football Uniforms Bid 19-oor1g

Documents for the Football Uniforms Bid 19-0o19 were issued on March 26, 2019. On Wednesday,
Avpril 10 2019, three proposals were received by EastBay Inc., Grogan Marciano Sporting Goods, and

Stadium System. I concur with Mr. Rix to award Grogan Marciano Sporting Goods.

Please add this request to the next School Committee meeting.
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MEMO
To:  Camely Machado
Tony Ferrucci

From: Ken Rix
Director of Athletics
Date: May 7, 2019

RE: Football Uniform Bid 19-0019

It is my recommendation that the WPS award the Toll Gate football Uniform Bid to Grogan
Marciano Sporting Goods. The WPS requested bids for both Adidas and Nike Uniforms.
The bids came back significantly higher for the Nike Uniforms. Two vendors submitted bids
for the Adidas Uniforms. Eastbay Sports and Grogan Marciano. Eastbay Inc submitted a bid
of $16,155.00. Grogan Marciano’s bid was $10,788.60. Stadium System Inc. added a bid
of $8991.00. However, Stadium Systems substituted the Uniform with their own brand:
Custom Gear Warriors. Both the Toll Gate Head Football Coach and | have seen the Adidas
Jerseys and believe that they are a quality product. Based on the above findings, please
award the Football Uniform Bid to Grogan Marciano Sports.

Please call me with any further questions.

Kenneth Rix, CAA

WARWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS DO NOT DISCRIMINATE ON THE BASIS OF AGE, SEX, SEXUAL ORIENTATION, RACE,
RELIGION, NATIONAL ORIGIN, COLOR, OR DISABILITY IN ACCORDANCE WITH APPLICABLE LAWS AND REGULATIONS.



WARWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

FOOTBALL UNIFORMS BID 19-0019

TABULATION
ITEM # DESCRIPTION QUANITY UNIT PRICE S&H TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE S&H TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE| S&H |TOTAL PRICE
1 Adidas Men's Football Game Jersey 60 $117.00 $0.75 $7,065.00 $74.98 $0.00 $4,498.80 $59.95 $0.00 $3,597.00
Style # AD0832M - - - - - - - - - -
2 Adidas Men's Football Game Jersey 60 $117.00 $0.75 $7,065.00 $74.98 $0.00 $4,498.80 $59.95 $0.00 $3,597.00
Style # AD0832M - - - - - - - - - -
3 Adidas Men's Football Game Pant 60 $33.00 $0.75 $2,025.00 $29.85 $0.00 $1,791.00 $29.95 $0.00 $1,797.00
Style # 690P - - - - - - - - - -
$16,155.00 $10,788.60 $8,991.00
4 Nike Custom Vapor Pro Jersey 60 $118.00 $0.75 $7,125.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Style # NSPCUSTOM - - - - - - - - - -
5 Nike Custom Vapor Pro Jersey 60 $118.00 $0.75 $7,125.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Style # NSPCUSTOM - - - - - - - - - -
6 Navy Vapor Varsity Football Pant 60 $39.00 $0.75 $2,345.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Style # NK908728 - - - - - - - - - -
$16,595.00 NO BID NO BID
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