



WARWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Dr. Phillip Thornton
Superintendent of Schools

Kenneth Rix, CAA
Director of Athletics

69 Draper Avenue
Warwick, Rhode Island 02889
TEL: (401) 794-5000
FAX: (401) 921-6737

MEMO

To: Camely Machado
Tony Ferrucci

From: Ken Rix
Director of Athletics

Date: July 22, 2019

RE: Athletic Supplies and Equipment Bid #19-0031

It is my recommendation that the WPS award the Athletic Supplies and Equipment Bid to **Grogan Marciano Sporting Goods**. There were four vendors that bid: Grogan, Eastbay, Pyramid School Products and Stadium Systems. Grogan Marciano was significantly cheaper on many of the supplies. In addition, the three other vendors failed to submit a bid on several items and in some cases offered a substitute product. Grogan Marciano submitted bids on the majority of supplies. Finally, we have dealt with and purchased a significant amount of Athletic Equipment / Supplies from Grogan in the past and feel that they are a reliable vendor.

Please call me with any further questions.

Kenneth Rix, CAA

Wenatch Public Schools
 Athletic Supplies & Equipment Bid #19-0031

TABULATION
 Quotes will be placed on an awarded basis

Item	Quantity	Unit	Price Per Unit	Bid	Total	Eastbay, Inc.		Oregon Marciano Sporting Goods		Pyramit School Products		Spartan Systems		Year
						Client Name	Price Per Unit	SAV	Total	Price Per Unit	SAV	Client Name	Price Per Unit	
BASKETBALL														
1	26	Shoe	\$72.50	\$106.00	\$2,702.06	\$62.81	-	\$2,287.16	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$71.00	-	\$2,556.06
2	2	Shoe	\$49.90	\$6.00	\$124.06	\$41.91	-	\$89.07	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$49.00	-	\$99.06
3	1	Shoe	\$1.75	\$2.00	\$3.75	\$1.16	-	\$1.66	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
4	20	Shoe	\$17.00	\$68.00	\$2,600.00	\$12.77	-	\$2,000.64	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$2,048.20	-	\$2,239.64
5	2	Shoe	\$25.75	\$3.00	\$28.75	\$26.44	-	\$28.44	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
6	4	Shoe	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
7	4	Shoe	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
8	1	Shoe	\$61.25	\$23.00	\$79.25	\$56.06	-	\$59.06	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
9	1	Shoe	\$61.25	\$19.00	\$79.25	\$27.19	-	\$37.19	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
10	1	Shoe	\$23.50	\$19.00	\$20.50	\$27.28	-	\$27.28	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
11	48	Shoe	\$4.00	\$4.00	\$194.88	\$3.98	-	\$191.08	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$23.00	-	NO BID
12	48	Shoe	\$4.40	\$4.00	\$202.20	\$2.86	-	\$140.24	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$162.24	-	\$197.12
13	48	Shoe	\$4.40	\$4.00	\$202.20	\$2.86	-	\$140.24	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$162.24	-	\$197.12
14	26	Shoe	\$4.40	\$4.00	\$118.40	\$2.86	-	\$197.26	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$121.86	-	\$182.64
BASKETBALL														
1	1	Shoe	\$16.90	\$3.00	\$17.90	\$22.80	-	\$22.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
2	1	Shoe	\$8.15	\$2.00	\$8.75	\$7.20	-	\$9.60	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$1.77	-	NO BID
3	4	Shoe	\$106.00	\$10.00	\$444.00	\$7.20	-	\$334.40	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
4	1	Shoe	\$46.80	\$2.00	\$48.80	\$29.97	-	\$28.80	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
5	12	Shoe	\$46.00	\$24.00	\$204.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
6	12	Shoe	\$46.00	\$24.00	\$204.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID
7	12	Shoe	\$51.50	\$24.00	\$600.00	\$48.84	-	\$598.88	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$51.30	-	NO BID
8	12	Shoe	\$23.50	\$24.00	\$600.00	\$48.84	-	\$598.88	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$51.30	-	NO BID
9	19	Shoe	\$23.50	\$16.00	\$416.00	\$48.84	-	\$416.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$48.00	-	NO BID
10	4	Shoe	\$23.50	\$16.00	\$416.00	\$48.84	-	\$416.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$48.00	-	NO BID
11	4	Shoe	\$23.50	\$16.00	\$416.00	\$48.84	-	\$416.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$48.00	-	NO BID
FIELD HOCKEY														
1	3	Shoe	\$75.00	\$18.00	\$239.06	\$72.08	-	\$216.80	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$23.00	-	\$179.87
2	48	Shoe	\$8.50	\$5.00	\$324.06	\$5.46	-	\$272.60	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$5.40	-	\$267.60
3	1	Shoe	\$8.25	\$1.00	\$9.25	\$7.45	-	\$8.45	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$7.40	-	\$8.40
4	1	Shoe	\$8.25	\$1.00	\$9.25	\$7.45	-	\$8.45	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$7.40	-	\$8.40
5	4	Shoe	\$8.00	\$4.00	\$36.00	\$7.26	-	\$29.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$7.20	-	\$29.00
6	25	Shoe	\$4.40	\$12.50	\$112.50	\$2.98	-	\$80.42	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$68.82	-	\$109.15
7	24	Shoe	\$4.40	\$12.50	\$112.50	\$2.98	-	\$80.42	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$68.82	-	\$109.15
8	24	Shoe	\$4.40	\$12.50	\$112.50	\$2.98	-	\$80.42	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$68.82	-	\$109.15
9	25	Shoe	\$4.40	\$12.50	\$112.50	\$2.98	-	\$80.42	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$68.82	-	\$109.15
FOOTBALL														
1	12	Shoe	\$71.00	\$22.00	\$674.00	\$68.89	-	\$279.66	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$68.50	-	\$822.16
2	12	Shoe	\$76.00	\$22.00	\$692.00	\$68.89	-	\$620.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$72.00	-	\$887.00
3	12	Shoe	\$1.75	\$1.00	\$41.00	\$1.87	-	\$196.72	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$4.50	-	\$24.00
4	12	Shoe	\$75.00	\$40.00	\$3,240.00	\$239.11	-	\$2,879.52	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$250.00	-	\$1,000.00
*Must be able to exchange size within 24 hours														
5	150	Shoe	\$8.44	\$3.00	\$493.50	\$6.41	-	\$40.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$6.40	-	\$49.00
6	150	Shoe	\$8.44	\$3.00	\$493.50	\$6.41	-	\$40.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$6.40	-	\$49.00
7	200	Shoe	\$8.44	\$6.00	\$1,440.00	\$6.46	-	\$736.00	NO BID	-	NO BID	\$8.40	-	\$1,472.00
8	1	Shoe	\$1.50	\$1.00	\$4.50	\$1.72	-	\$1.76	NO BID	-	NO BID	NO BID	-	NO BID

