

CITY OF WARWICK

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

NO: _____

APPROVED: _____

MAYOR

DATE: _____

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following bid(s):

Bid #	Name	Vendor(s) Name/Address	Contract Award	Contract Period	Note	Code	Fiscal Year
2019 - 237	Fire Apparatus Repair	<i>Shelton's Fire Equipment Co., Inc.</i> Waterford, CT 06385 <i>C & S Specialty, Inc.</i> N. Smithfield, RI 02896 <i>On Scene, LLC</i> E. Greenwich, RI 02818 <i>NR Fire Equipment & Apparatus Corp.</i> N. Haven, CT 06473 <i>Five Star Fire</i> Hartford, CT 06114 <i>Minuteman Trucks, Inc.</i> Walpole, MA 02081 <i>Truck Pro, LLC</i> <i>Atvia Personal Services</i> Pawtucket, RI 02860	\$50,000.00	6/8/19 - 6/7/20			

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

Bid 2019-277 Fire Apparatus Repair

- 7 bids received

CODE: 65-314 Automotive/Equipment Repair
MANNER OF AWARD: \$50,000.00
June 8, 2019 – June 7, 2020
RECOMMEND: Shipman's Fire
C & S Specialty, Inc.
On Scene, LLC
NE Fire Equipment
Five Star Fire
Minuteman Trucks, Inc.
Truck Pro d/b/a Pascale Services

Shipman's Fire Equipment Co., Inc.	172 Cross Rd.	Waterford, CT 06385
C & S Specialty, Inc.	1181 Old Scitubfield Rd.	N. Scitubfield, RI 02896
On Scene, LLC	5600 Post Rd.	E. Greenwich, RI 02818
NE Fire Equipment & Apparatus Corp.	10 Stillman Rd.	N. Haven, CT 06473
Five Star Fire	45 Brainard Rd.	Hartford, CT 06114
Minuteman Trucks, Inc.	2181 Providence Hwy.	Walpole, MA 02081
Truck Pro, LLC d/b/a Pascale Services	51 Delta Dr.	Pawtucket, RI 02860

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page

Description	Shipman's	C & S	On-Scene	NE Fire	Five Star Fire <i>(see note 2)</i>	Maintenance	Truck Per d/ha Pasquale
Pumper Truck Repairs	<i>(see note 1)</i> \$98.00/hr.	\$108.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	No bid
Aerial Ladder Truck (All vehicle except aerial & hydraulic components)	\$98.00/hr.	\$108.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	No bid
Aerial Ladder Truck (Aerial ladder and hydraulic components repairs)	\$98.00/hr.	\$135.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	No bid
Special Haz/Heavy Rescue	\$98.00/hr.	\$108.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	No bid
All above equipment (Engines & Transmission Repairs)	Minor repairs \$98.00/hr. Major Repairs (subcontract) 10% over invoice	\$108.00/hr. limited engine, no transmission	\$125.00/hr.	\$125.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	\$145.00/hr.	\$105.00/hr.
Parts % off list price	15%	Varies by mfg.	18%	10%	25%	15%	15%
NOTE							
1. Department of Public Works to deliver & pickup apparatus at Shipman's Fire Equipment. OPTION: Pickup & delivery by Shipman's Fire \$47,000/car.							
2. Freight is considered billable and will be on repair orders.							



CITY OF WARWICK
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, RI 02889
TEL: 401-738-2808
FAX 401-732-5208

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

MATHEW J. SOLITRO
DIRECTOR

To: Patricia Peslka, Purchasing Agent

From: Mathew Solitro, Director of Public Works MS

Date: April 8, 2019

Re: Bid 2019-277 Fire Apparatus Repairs

We have reviewed the seven bids submitted and recommend award to New England Fire Apparatus, On Scene, LLC, E&S Specialty, Inc., Minuteman Trucks, Inc., Pascale Services, Shipman's Fire Equipment Co., Inc. and Five Star Fire. This department will send fire apparatus for repairs that cannot be done in house based on the hourly rate submitted and manufacturer of said vehicle, the illness of repair for vehicle of to be returned to service and proximity to the City. The current bid expires on June 7, 2019. The new contract period will be June 8, 2019 to June 7, 2020. The requested award amount is \$50,000.